Fire/International Fire Code Adoption/November 21, 2011

Page 3 of 43

(d)

(e)

and other codes adopted by the Cify shall be made in accordance
therewith.

Section 102.7. Section 102.7 shall be amended by deleting Section 102,7
in its entirety and adding a new Section 102.7 to read as follows:

102.7 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and standards
referenced in this code shall be those that are listed in Chapter 47 and such
codes, when specifically adopted, and standards shall be considered part of
the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such
reference. Where differences occur between the provisions of this code
and the referenced standards, the provisions of this code shall apply.
Whenever amendments have been adopted to the referenced codes and
standards, each reference to said code and standard shall be considered to
reference the amendments as well. Any reference to NFPA 70 or the ICC
Electrical Code shall mean the Electrical Code as adopted.

Section 105.1.4. Section 105 shall be amended by adding a new Section
105.1.4 to read as follows:

105.1.4 Permit fees. A permit fee shall be paid prior to conducting
activities as follows:

1. Fire alarm systems. The installation, addition to or
alteration of a fire alarm system.

2 Fire sprinkler systems. The installation, addition to or
alteration of a fire sprinkler system.

3. Fire suppression systems. The installation of, addition to
or alteration of a fire suppression system.

4. Underground storage tanks. The installation, removal,
addition to or alteration of underground storage tanks and
piping for the storage of hazardous materials especially
Sflammable liquids.

3. Aboveground storage tanks. The installation, removal,
addition to or alteration of aboveground storage tanks and
piping for the storage of hazardous materials especially
flammable liquids.

6. Open burning.

7. Fireworks displays. To conduct fireworks and
pyrotechnics displays.

8. Access control gates. To install new or alter existing
access control gates across access roads and fire lanes.



Fire/International Fire Code Adoption/November 21, 2011

Page 4 0f 43

0.

® Section 105.1.5.

Explosive materials. The storage, use or detonation of
explosive materials,

Exception: Permit fees shall not be required on
work on any building or structure, the title to which
is directly vested in the federal government, state,

-county, city or a public school district.

Section 105 shall be amended by adding a new Section

105.1.5 to read as follows:

105.1.5 Permit fee schedule.

L.

Permit fee schedule. The following permit fee schedule
shall be charged for the installation, addition to or alteration
of the following:

Fire sprinkler systems:

1 - 19 heads $100.00
20 — 100 heads $150.00
100 — 200 heads $200.00

Fire Sprinkler Systems exceeding 200 heads will be
$200.00 plus $0.50 for each additional head. An
additional fee of $50.00 shall be charged for each
test exceeding one per permit. The testing fee shall
be paid prior to conducting the test.

Fire alarm systems:

1 - 10 devices $100.00
11— 25 devices $150.00
26 — 100 devices $200.00

Fire Alarm Systems exceeding 100 devices shall be
$200.00 plus $1.00 for each additional device. An
additional fee of $50.00 shall be charged for each
test exceeding one per permit. The testing fee shall
be paid prior to conducting the test.

Fire suppression systems: $75.00 per system.
Underground or aboveground storage tanks

(does not include temporary tanks or residential
propane):



Fire/International Fire Code Adoption/November 21, 2011

Page 5 of 43

i, $100.00 per tank for installation of or
removal of underground tanks.

ii. $100.00 for the permit and inspection of
underground piping.

- Access control gates (across a fire lane). The
installation of or alteration of an access control gate
across a fire lane or access road shall be $100.00
per gate.

L. Open burning/trench burning.
1 $50.00 per day.

il A permit fee is not required for a campfire,
flag retirement ceremony or similar event,

g Explosive materials. See fee for fireworks and
pyrotechnics displays in 105.1.5 (2) below.

Permit fees. A fee of $50.00 shall be charged for the
following permits:

a. Fireworks and py{-otechnics displays.
b. Temporary aboveground tanks to include:
i Propane exchange stations.
ii. Residential propane.
iii. Temporary tank at a construction site.

C. Reinspections. A $50.00 reinspection fee shall be
charged for each reinspection of a fire alarm
system, fire sprinkler system, fire suppression
system, underground storage tank and aboveground
storage tanks.

Investigation fee. An investigation shall be made
whenever any work for which a permit is required by this
code has commenced without first obtaining a permiz. An
investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall be
collected whether or not a permit is subsequently issued.
The payment of such investigation fee shall not exempt any
person from compliance with all other provisions of this
code nor from any penalty prescribed by law. The



Fire/International Fire Code Adoption/November 21, 2011

Page 6 0f 43

(8)

(b)

(i)

0)

investigation fee shall be equal to the amount of the permit
fee required by this code not to exceed $2,000.00.

4, Third party review fee. A third party review fee shall be
paid in addition to the permir fee where an impartial third
party reviews a permit submiftal and makes code-related
comments. The third party shall be selected by the fire
code official and have extensive experience and knowledge
in the field to be reviewed. This review process shall be
utilized for permit submittals with fire system technology
not normally permitted. The third party review fee shall be
the cost of the review plus associated shipping or courier
cost.

2 Inspection after normal business hours fee. Inspections
may be conducted after hours or on Saturdays at the request
of a contractor if inspection personnel are available, The
fee for such inspections shall be $100.00 per hour per
inspector with a two-hour minimum per inspector.

Section 105.3.3. Section 105.3.3 shall be amended by deleting Section
105.3.3 in its entirety and adding a new Section 105.3.3 to read as follows:

105.3.3 Occupancy prohibited before approval. The building or
structure shall not be occupied prior to the fire code official issuing a
permit when required and conducting associated inspections indicating the
applicable provisions of this code have been met.

Section 105.7.15. Section 105 shall be amended by adding a new Section
105.7.15 to read as follows:

105.7.15 Smoke control or exhaust systems. Construction permits are
required for smoke control or exhaust systems as specified in Section 909
and Section 910 respectively. Maintenance performed in accordance with
this code is not considered a modification and does not require a permit. .

Section 105.7.16. Section 105 shall be amended by adding a new Section
105.7.16 to read as follows:

105.7.16 Electronic access control systems. Construction permits are
required for the installation or modification of an electronic access control
system, as specified in Section 503 and Section 1008. A separate
construction permit is required for the installation or modification of a fire
alarm system that may be connected to the access control system.
Maintenance performed in accordance with this code is not considered a
modification and does not require a permit.

Section 108. Section 108 shall be amended by deleting Section 108 in its
entirety and adding a new Section 108 to read as follows:



